

**KPC – Kentucky Purchasing Cooperatives  
LINE ITEM BID CERTIFICATION – BREAD-LI-2008-08**

**STATEMENT OF SUBMISSION**

We have read all the conditions and requirements of the bid invitation. In compliance with all general and specific terms and conditions of the bid invitation, in consideration of the detailed description attached hereto, and subject to the statements of Authentication, Non-Collusion, and Non-Conflict of Interest thereof, the undersigned agrees that, upon proper acceptance by the KEDC Board of Directors of any part of the bid offer within the time stipulated, a contract shall thereby be created in accordance with the specifications for that part of the bid offer accepted.

Earthgrains Baking Co. Inc  
Bidding Firm

7/9/08  
Date

Richard Thompson  
Administrative Contact Name

502-238-5818  
Administrative Contact Phone

1811 Taylor Ave  
Administrative Contact Address

Richard Thompson  
Sales Contact Name

502-238-5810  
Sales Contact Phone

1811 Taylor Ave  
Sales Address

Web Address

Richard Thompson  
Authorizing Signature

Richard Thompson  
Printed Name of Authorized Signatory

richard.thompson@saralee.com  
Administrative Contact Email Address

502-238-5720  
Administrative Contact Fax

Louisville, Ky 40213  
Administrative City, State, Zip

richard.thompson@saralee.com  
Sales Contact Email Address

502-238-5720  
Sales Contact Fax

Louisville, Ky 40213  
Sales City, State, Zip

71-0051040  
Federal Identification Number

**CONTRACTOR INFORMATION:**

1. Day(s) of week deliveries will be made Mon-Tues-Thurs-Fri
2. Number of deliveries per month 16
3. Explain deliveries: (e.g., Are they on cycles or set days of the week?) Mon-Tues-Thurs-Fri

4. Please provide the following contact information. Please use the blank lines to submit any other pertinent contact information.

	Contact Name	Contact Phone Number	Contact E-mail Address
Placing Orders	Will be provided by District Managers		
Order Changes			
Customer Service			
Cooler Repairs			
Delivery Driver			

**2008 KPC Preferred Vendor  
Bakery Bid**

**Vendor Name:**

**EARTHGRAINS BAKING CO INC**

Prompt payment discount percentage:

Prompt payment discount terms (Net Days):

Many districts are applying for the Federal USDA U.S. Healthy School certification which mandates the use of whole grain breads (not enriched). Whole grain breads must be stock items. Provide the nutritional label for each item bid. Whole wheat items must list whole wheat as the first ingredient (not enriched).

Item Description	Brand	#Qty per pack	# to make single serving	Weight per pack	Bid Price	Sugar Content Per Serving	Fat Content Per Serving
<b>Bread, Sliced</b>							
Bread, potato bread (no flour content)					NO BID		
Bread, round top, white	Colonial	22 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.10		
Bread, round top, white wheat	Sara Lee	18 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.24		
Bread, round top, wheat	Sara Lee	18 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.21		
Bread, round top, whole wheat	Sara Lee	18 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.21		
Bread, sandwich loaf, white	Colonial/ Sunbeam	22 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.10		
Bread, sandwich loaf, white wheat					NO BID		
Bread, sandwich loaf, wheat	Colonial	22 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.21		
Bread, sandwich loaf, whole wheat					NO BID		
Bread, texas toast, white	Colonial	17 slices	1	24 oz	\$ 1.18		
24 count Small buns sheet (Similar to White Castle size)	Colonial	24		1 24oz	\$ 2.13		
<b>4" Hamburger Buns, Sliced</b>							
8 count pack	Colonial (3.5")	8		1 13 oz	\$ 0.75		
1 dozen pack	Colonial	12		1 22 oz	\$ 1.17		
30 count buns	Colonial	30		1 60 oz	\$ 2.90		
<b>4" Hamburger Buns. Onion, Sliced</b>							
8 count pack					NO BID		
1 dozen pack					NO BID		
Tray Pack					NO BID		

**2008 KPC Preferred Vendor  
Bakery Bid**

**Vendor Name:**

**EARTHGRAINS BAKING CO INC**

Prompt payment discount percentage:

Prompt payment discount terms (Net Days):

Many districts are applying for the Federal USDA U.S. Healthy School certification which mandates the use of whole grain breads (not enriched). Whole grain breads must be stock items. Provide the nutritional label for each item bid. Whole wheat items must list whole wheat as the first ingredient (not enriched).

Item Description	Brand	#Qty per pack	# to make single serving	Weight per pack	Bid Price	Sugar Content Per Serving	Fat Content Per Serving
<b>4" Hamburger Buns, Potato, Sliced</b>							
8 count pack					NO BID		
1 dozen pack					NO BID		
Tray Pack					NO BID		
<b>4" Hamburger Buns, Wheat, Sliced</b>							
8 count pack	Sara Lee	8	1	12 OZ	\$ 0.88		
1 dozen pack					NO BID		
30 count buns					NO BID		
<b>4" Hamburger Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced</b>							
8 count pack	Sara Lee (3.75")	8		1 21 OZ	\$ 1.16		
1 dozen pack					NO BID		
30 count buns					NO BID		
<b>Hot Dog Buns, Sliced</b>							
8 count pack	Colonial	8		1 12 OZ	\$ 0.77		
1 dozen pack	Sunny	12		1 18 oz	\$ 1.17		
24 count pack					NO BID		
Tray of 5 dozen					NO BID		
<b>Hot Dog Buns, Wheat, Sliced</b>							
8 count pack	Sara Lee	8		1 12 oz	\$ 0.90		
1 dozen pack					NO BID		

**2008 KPC Preferred Vendor  
Bakery Bid**

**Vendor Name:**

**EARTHGRAINS BAKING CO INC**

Prompt payment discount percentage:

Prompt payment discount terms (Net Days):

Many districts are applying for the Federal USDA U.S. Healthy School certification which mandates the use of whole grain breads (not enriched). Whole grain breads must be stock items. Provide the nutritional label for each item bid. Whole wheat items must list whole wheat as the first ingredient (not enriched).

Item Description	Brand	#Qty per pack	# to make single serving	Weight per pack	Bid Price	Sugar Content Per Serving	Fat Content Per Serving
24 count pack					NO BID		
Tray of 5 dozen					NO BID		
<b>Hot Dog Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced</b>							
8 count pack	Sara Lee	8	1	12 OZ	\$ 0.90		
1 dozen pack					NO BID		
24 count pack					NO BID		
Tray of 5 dozen					NO BID		
<b>Steak Bun (Hoagie style)</b>							
8 count	Sara Lee	6		1 16 oz	\$ 1.16		
24 count	Colonial	24		1 56 oz	\$ 4.32		
<b>Steak Bun, Wheat (Hoagie style)</b>							
8 count					NO BID		
24 count					NO BID		
<b>Steak Bun, Whole Wheat (Hoagie style)</b>							
8 count					NO BID		
24 count					NO BID		
<b>Miscellaneous</b>							
5 1/2" sesame seed Slim Jim Bun	Sara Lee	6		1 16 oz	\$ 1.25		
Brown n Serve Rolls 12 pack	Colonial	12		1 12 oz	\$ 0.90		
Donuts - Individual Pkg Chocolate					NO BID		
Donuts - Individual Pkg Powdered					NO BID		



# Bakery Vendor Service Area

EARTHGRANS BAKING CO / SARA LEE

Vendor Name:

Can your Company Serve all KPC Members? Yes/No **NO**

GRREC	Participational Interest	With You	KEDC	Participational Interest	With You	MKCES	Participational Interest	With You	SESC	Participational Interest	With You
Adair Co.	NR		ACTC	NR		Beechwood Ind.	NR		Bell County	NR	
Allert Co.	Y	Y	Ashland Ind.	NR		Bellevue Ind.	Y	Y	Berea Ind.	Y	Y
Barren Co.	Y	Y	Augusta Ind.	Y	Y	Boone Co.	NR	NR	Burgin Ind.	U	Y
Bowling Green Ind.	N		Barbourville Ind.	NR	Y	Campbell Co.	NR	NR	Casey Co.	U	Y
Breckinridge Co.	Y	Y	Bath Co.	Y		Covington Ind.	Y	Y	Corbin Ind.	Y	Y
Butler Co.	NR		Boyd Co.	N		Dayton Independent	NR	NR	East Bernstadt Ind.	NR	Y
Campbellsville Ind./Taylor Co.	Y	Y	Bullitt Co.	Y	Y	Erlanger-Elsmere Ind.	NR	NR	Estill Co.	N	Y
Caverna Ind.	Y	Y	Carter Co.	Y	Y	Ft. Thomas Ind.	NR	NR	Garrard Co.	NR	Y
Clinton Co.	NR		Elliott Co.	NR		Gateway Community & Technical	NA		Jackson Co.	NR	Y
Cloverport Ind.	NR		Fairview Ind.	NR		Grant Co.	NR	NR	Lincoln Co.	Y	Y
Cumberland Co.	Y	Y	Fayette Co.	N		Kenton Co.	N	NR	Madison Co.	Y	Y
Daviess Co.	N		Fleming Co.	U		Ludlow Ind.	NR	NR	McCreary Co.	Y	Y
Edmonson County	Y	Y	Floyd Co.	NR		Newport Ind.	NR	NR	Mercer Co.	U	Y
Elizabethtown Ind.	NR		Greenup Co.	U		MKCES	NA		Middlesboro Ind.	NR	Y
Glasgow Ind.	NR		KEDC	NR		Pendleton Co.	Y	Y	Monicello Ind.	NR	Y
Grayson Co.	NR		Knox Co.	NR		Silver Grove Ind.	Y	Y	Pineville Ind.	NR	Y
Green Co.	Y	Y	Lawrence Co.	NR		Souffigate Ind.	NR	NR	Powell Co.	NR	Y
GRREC	NA		Lewis Co.	NR		Wilton Verona Ind.	Y	Y	Pulaski Co.	Y	Y
Hancock Co.	NR		Leslie Co.	NR		Williamstown Ind.	Y	Y	Rockcastle Co.	NR	Y
Hardin Co.	N		Lewis Co.	U		*NKU	NA		Russell Co.	NR	Y
Hart Co.	Y	Y	Magoffin Co.	Y		KPC			Science Hill Ind.	NR	Y
LaRue Co.	NR		Manion Co.	NR		Advance Memorial UMC	NA		SESC	NA	
Logan Co.	Y	Y	Martin Co.	N		Archdiocese of Louisville	Y	Y	Somerset Ind.	Y	Y
Meade Co.	Y	Y	Mason Co.	Y		Bardstown Ind.	NR	NR	Wayne County	Y	Y
Malcalfe Co.	NR		Menifee Co.	NR		Berea College	NA	NA	Whitley Co	Y	Y
Monroe Co.	NR		Morgan Co.	NR		Breathitt County	NR	NR	*EKU	NA	
Ohio Co.	NR		Nelson Co.	NR		Christian Academy	NA				
Owensboro Ind.	NR		Paintsville Ind.	Y	Y	Class Act Federal Credit Union	NA				
Russellsville Ind.	NR		Perry Co.	NR		Diocese of Covington	NA				
Simpson Co.	NR		Pike Co.	N		Evangel Christian School	NA				
Taylor Co./Campbellsville Ind.	Y	Y	Raceland Ind.	NR		Greenup Co. Federal Credit Union	NA				
Todd Co.	Y	Y	Robertson Co.	NR		Henderson County	NR	NR			
Warren Co.	NR		Rowan Co.	N		Jackson Ind.	NR	NR			
*WKU	NA		Russell Ind.	NR		Kentucky Christian University	NA	NA			
			UK	NA		Kentucky Country Day School	NA	NA			
			Williamsburg Ind.	U	Y	Knot County	NR	NR			
			Wolfe Co.	NR	Y	KPC	NA	NA			
			*WSU	NA		Lakeside Christian Church	NA	NA			
						Louisville Collegiate School	NA	NA			
						Minford Local Schools-Ohio	NR	NR			
						Murray Ind.	NR	NR			
						Owsley County	N	Y			
						Paramount Arts Center	NA	NA			
						Paris Ind.	NR	NR			
						Portland Christian Schools	NA	NA			
						Saint Mark School	NA	NA			
						Scott County	NR	NR			
						Shelby County	NR	NR			
						Warren County Fiscal Court	NA	NA			
						Washington County	NR	NR			

Participation Interest Legend	Yes
Y	Yes
N	No
U	Undecided
NR	No Response
NA	Not Applicable

\* Partner University